
andrewe@jccal.org 

ITEM NO. 1

Grade CRS-2

Super  Fund Charge                                                   

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 2

Grade CRS-2H:

Super  Fund Charge                                                   

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 3

Grade CRS-2P:

Super Fund Charge:                                                   

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 4

Grade RS-2:

Super Fund Charge:                                                   

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 5

Grade MP-1:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 6

Grade MC-250:

Super Fund Charge:                                                   

+

Total Price:

ITEM NO. 7

Grade MC-70:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 8

Grade CRS02HP:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.0915$               

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1.7900

2.0900

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

 $ 

 $              0.0015 

 $        627,450.00 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $              2.0900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 
 $  $  $  $  $  $              2.0915  $  $  $  $ 

 $                     -   

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 
 $  $  $  $  $  $                     -    $  $  $  $ 

 $  $ 

        3,000 

 $  $  $  $  $  $                     -    $  $  $  $ 

NO BID

 $  $                     -    $  $  $  $ 
      200,000 

 $                     -   

 $  $ 

      300,000 
 $  $  $  $  $  $                     -    $  $  $ 

 $                     -   

 $              0.0015 
      100,000 

 $  $  $  $  $ 

 $        209,150.00 

 $  $  $  $ 

 $        537,450.00 

 $              0.0015 
      300,000 

 $  $  $  $  $  $              1.7915  $  $  $  $ 

 $        537,450.00 

NO BID NO BID

      300,000 
 $              0.0015 

 $  $  $  $  $  $              1.7915  $  $  $  $ 

ERICKA ANDREW, BUYER

TABULATION SHEET 

BID# 101-18 ASPHALT (EMULSIFIED)

WINSTON 

COUNTY
WALKER COUNTY BLOUNT COUNTY

ST. CLAIR 

COUNTY

PICKENS 

COUNTY

JEFFERSON 

COUNTY
SHELBY COUNTY

TUSCALOOSA 

COUNTY
BIBB       COUNTY

CHILTON 

COUNTY

ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS INC.
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

GALLONS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID1.7900 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION

mailto:andrewe@jccal.org


ITEM NO. 9

Grade CQS 1HP 3% Latex 

Tack:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 10

Grade CSS 1H Tackless Tack: 

CBC-1HT Trackless

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 11

Grade MC-70:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 12

Grade CRS-2HP:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 13

Grade CQS 1HP 3% Latex 

Tack:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

ITEM NO. 14

Grade CSS 1H Tackless Tack:

Super Fund Charge:                                                  

+

Total Price:

EXTENDED PRICE

GRAND TOTAL

0.0015

0.0015

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.0015

-$                              -$                              -$                              -$                              -$                              4,051,850.00$        -$                              -$                              -$                              -$                              

 $        756,450.00 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID2.5200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 

 $  $  $  $  $  $              2.5215  $  $  $  $ 

 $  $  $                     -    $  $  $  $ 

 $                     -   

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 

 $  $  $ 

 $        627,450.00 

 $  $  $  $  $              2.0915  $  $  $  $ 

 $                     -   

NO BID2.0900 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 
 $ 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 
 $  $  $  $  $  $                     -    $  $  $  $ 

 $        756,450.00 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $              2.5200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 

2.5215

 $                     -   

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDNO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

      300,000 

 $  $  $  $  $  $                     -    $  $  $  $ 

**Pricing is based on delivery of full truck transport quantities./ Demurrge: 2 hours free; $75/hr therafter./ Pump Charge: $75 - if needed. / Drop Tanker: $400/mo; $100/wk after first 4 weeks.**



7890 BIRMNGHAMPORT ROAD MULGA ALABAMA 35118 | ANTHONY QUATTLEBAUM P:205 -436-3413 E: ANTHONY.QUATTLEBAUM@ERGON.COM 

Addendum 2

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

GUARANTEED DELIVERY PER REGION

Addendum 1

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE - TUSCALOOSA COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE -  BIBB COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE - CHILTON COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE - WINSTON COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE -  WALKER COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE - BLOUNT COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE -  ST. CLAIR COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE -PICKENS COUNTY

1 DAY

YES

YES

ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS, INC.

Notification of Intent to Respond 

Signature Page

REQUIRED DOCUMENTS 

Affidavit of Contractor

EEOC Form

Price Sheet 

PACA Required Forms

Non-Collusion Affidavit

ERGON ASPHALT & EMULSIONS INC.

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

NO

CONTACT INFORMATION

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE - JEFFERSON COUNTY

1. DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN ___ DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE - SHELBY COUNTY

ERGON ASPHALT &  

EMULSIONS, INC.


